



VILLAGE OF
LINCOLNSHIRE
 PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

North Park/Florsheim Park Natural Areas Boardwalk Replacement Project

Contractors	Alliance Contractors Inc			Copenhaver Construction			Koville Constuction Co			Rasch Construction and Engineering		
	Materials Cost	Total Cost	Repairs only	Materials Cost	Total Cost	Repairs only	Materials Cost	Total Cost	Repairs only	Materials Cost	Total Cost	Repairs only
Boardwalk #1	\$ 34,650.00	\$ 130,900.00	\$ 73,150.00	\$ 31,164.00	\$ 105,700.00	\$ 62,000.00	\$ 27,104.00	\$ 61,600.00	no bid	\$ 15,400.00	\$ 40,810.00	no bid
Boardwalk #2	\$ 9,675.00	\$ 46,225.00	\$ 25,585.00	\$ 8,703.00	\$ 29,515.00	\$ 16,440.00	\$ 7,568.00	\$ 17,200.00	no bid	\$ 4,300.00	\$ 12,670.00	no bid
Boardwalk #3	\$ 8,325.00	\$ 39,775.00	\$ 22,015.00	\$ 7,488.00	\$ 25,396.00	\$ 14,173.00	\$ 6,512.00	\$ 14,800.00	no bid	\$ 3,850.00	\$ 11,625.00	no bid
Boardwalk #4	\$ 7,425.00	\$ 35,475.00	\$ 19,635.00	\$ 6,679.00	\$ 22,651.00	\$ 11,572.00	\$ 5,808.00	\$ 13,200.00	no bid	\$ 3,440.00	\$ 10,590.00	no bid
Boardwalk #5	\$ 13,500.00	\$ 64,500.00	\$ 35,700.00	\$ 12,143.00	\$ 33,923.00	\$ 18,862.00	\$ 7,920.00	\$ 18,000.00	no bid	\$ 4,680.00	\$ 13,700.00	no bid
Boardwalk #6	\$ 9,450.00	\$ 45,150.00	\$ 24,990.00	\$ 8,502.00	\$ 26,289.00	\$ 14,630.00	\$ 6,468.00	\$ 14,700.00	no bid	\$ 3,825.00	\$ 11,560.00	no bid
Boardwalk #7	\$ 24,075.00	\$ 90,950.00	\$ 50,825.00	\$ 21,653.00	\$ 73,441.00	\$ 40,941.00	\$ 18,822.00	\$ 42,800.00	no bid	\$ 10,700.00	\$ 28,970.00	no bid
Boardwalk #8	\$ 9,450.00	\$ 45,150.00	\$ 24,990.00	\$ 8,502.00	\$ 23,748.00	\$ 13,198.00	\$ 5,544.00	\$ 12,600.00	no bid	\$ 3,280.00	\$ 10,200.00	no bid
Boardwalk #9	\$ 13,050.00	\$ 62,350.00	\$ 34,510.00	\$ 11,736.00	\$ 32,790.00	\$ 18,204.00	\$ 7,656.00	\$ 17,400.00	no bid	\$ 4,525.00	\$ 13,320.00	no bid
Boardwalk #10	\$ 6,915.00	\$ 33,325.00	\$ 18,445.00	\$ 6,272.00	\$ 28,778.00	\$ 9,790.00	\$ 4,092.00	\$ 9,300.00	no bid	\$ 2,420.00	\$ 8,050.00	no bid
Boardwalk #11	\$ 8,775.00	\$ 41,925.00	\$ 23,205.00	\$ 7,895.00	\$ 22,052.00	\$ 12,289.00	\$ 5,148.00	\$ 11,700.00	no bid	\$ 3,050.00	\$ 9,620.00	no bid
Boardwalk #12	\$ 70,650.00	\$ 266,900.00	\$ 149,150.00	\$ 63,549.00	\$ 234,522.00	\$ 130,838.00	\$ 62,172.00	\$ 141,300.00	no bid	\$ 35,325.00	\$ 91,020.00	no bid
Boardwalk #13	\$ 8,775.00	\$ 44,925.00	\$ 23,205.00	\$ 63,549.00	\$ 234,522.00	\$ 130,838.00	\$ 62,172.00	\$ 141,300.00	no bid	\$ 4,570.00	\$ 13,420.00	no bid
Mobilization	\$ -	\$ 1.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 70,613.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 30,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 25,000.00	\$ -
Total Cost	\$ 224,715.00	\$ 947,551.00	\$ 525,405.00	\$ 257,835.00	\$ 963,940.00	\$ 493,775.00	\$ 226,986.00	\$ 545,900.00	no bid	\$ 99,365.00	\$ 300,555.00	no bid