



October 25, 2023 Bid Opening - 10:00am - Natural Areas Maintenance and Controlled Burning

Location	Native Restoration Services, Inc			Tallgrass Restorations, LLC		
	2024 Season	2025 Season	2026 Season	2024 Season	2025 Season	2026 Season
Herbicide as Needed	\$ 47.50	\$ 48.00	\$ 48.50	\$ 85.00	\$ 87.50	\$ 90.00
Pull/Spray Garlic Mustard w/Round-Up	\$ 47.50	\$ 48.00	\$ 48.50	\$ 85.00	\$ 87.50	\$ 90.00
Spraying/Herbiciding	\$ 47.50	\$ 48.00	\$ 48.50	\$ 85.00	\$ 87.50	\$ 80.00
Path Mowing	\$ 47.50	\$ 48.00	\$ 48.50	\$ 85.00	\$ 113.50	\$ 117.00
Path Chipping (chips provided)	\$ 47.50	\$ 48.00	\$ 48.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Path Chipping (chips not provided)	\$ 47.50	\$ 48.00	\$ 48.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Controlled Burning Prices:						
North Park Natural Area	\$ 5,580.00	\$ 5,580.00	\$ 5,580.00	\$ 12,100.00	\$ 12,460.00	\$ 12,840.00
Florsheim nature Preserve	\$ 6,880.00	\$ 6,880.00	\$ 6,880.00	\$ 24,100.00	\$ 24,820.00	\$ 25,570.00
Old Mill Woods	\$ 5,175.00	\$ 5,175.00	\$ 5,175.00	\$ 12,100.00	\$ 12,460.00	\$ 12,840.00
Rivershire Park	\$ 2,575.00	\$ 2,575.00	\$ 2,575.00	\$ 5,500.00	\$ 5,665.00	\$ 5,840.00
Spring Lake Pond	\$ 1,175.00	\$ 1,175.00	\$ 1,175.00	\$ 1,900.00	\$ 1,960.00	\$ 2,020.00
Village Hall Pond	\$ 950.00	\$ 950.00	\$ 950.00	\$ 3,100.00	\$ 3,190.00	\$ 3,290.00
Total Bid	\$ 22,335.00	\$ 22,335.00	\$ 22,335.00	\$ 58,880.00	\$ 60,555.00	\$ 62,400.00
Hourly Rate Per Crew Member	\$ 47.50	\$ 48.00	\$ 48.50	\$ 150.00	\$ 154.50	\$ 160.00